MINUTES
Town of New Gloucester

BOARD OF ASSESSOR’S & BOARD OF SELECTMEN’S MEETING
7:00 p.m.

Monday, July 18, 2011
At the Meetinghouse

BOARD OF ASSESSOR’S MEETING

7:00 p.m.
 I.
CALL THE MEETING TO ORDER & ATTENDANCE 

Chairman, Steven Libby, called the meeting to order at 7:00 p.m.  Present were Chairman, Steven Libby; Vice Chairman, Linda Chase; Selectmen, Mark Leighton, Joshua McHenry and Mark Stevens; Town Manager, Sumner Field; and Recorder, Sharlene Myers.

II.
To See What Action the Board Wishes to Take in Regards to Exempt Status for The Royal River Conservation Trust
Mr. McHenry moved and Mr. Leighton seconded a motion to approve and sign the Exempt Status application for The Royal River Conservation Trust.  The motion carried on a vote of 4-1, with Mr. Libby opposing.   

III.
ADJOURN

Mr. Leighton moved and Mr. Stevens seconded a motion to adjourn the Board of Assessor’s meeting at 7:06 p.m.   The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.
BOARD OF SELECTMEN’S MEETING

I.
CALL THE MEETING TO ORDER & ATTENDANCE 

Chairman, Steven Libby, called the meeting to order at 7:06 p.m.  Present were Chairman, Steven Libby; Vice Chairman, Linda Chase; Selectmen, Mark Leighton, Joshua McHenry and Mark Stevens; Town Manager, Sumner Field; and Recorder, Sharlene Myers.

II.
SCHEDULED NEXT MEETING:

Board of Selectmen – 7:00 p.m., Monday, August 1, 2011 at the Meetinghouse


The Board cancelled the August 1st Board of Selectmen’s meeting unless it becomes necessary to have one.


A.
Adjustments to the Agenda 
Mr. Leighton moved and Mr. McHenry seconded a motion to add Item 4.11, To See What Action the Board Wishes to Take in Regards to a Game of Chance Lucky 7 Application for the Lunn-Hunnewell Amvets Post #6.   The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.
Mr. Leighton moved and Mr. McHenry seconded a motion to add Item 4.12, To See What Action the Board Wishes to Take in Regards to Rolling Over Funds from FY11 to FY12.   The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.
III.
PUBLIC PARTICIPATION  

A. Presentation by Joe Kazar, Mid Maine Waste Action Corporation
Joe Kazar, Executive Director of Mid Maine Waste Action Corporation (MMWAC), said MMWAC is a non-profit quasi-municipal Corporation owned by twelve Towns (Auburn, Bowdoin, Buckfield, Lovell, Minot, Monmouth, New Gloucester, Poland, Raymond, Sumner, Sweden, and Wales) and formed in 1986.   He said MMWAC operates a safe, dependable waste disposal facility that lessens landfill needs and minimizes air pollution by creating clean renewable domestic energy from waste.  He said most of the electricity created by incinerating trash is sold to Central Maine Power, with some being used to run the MMWAC facility.  Mr. Kazar said up next for MMWAC:  seek renewable energy credits; debt is to expire in late 2014; reserve holds steady at $5 million to protect against the need for further debt and allow for capital improvements; each member municipality owns a proportionate share of MMWAC; and MMWAC is considering a name change.    

B.
Other

Jean Couturier, Bennett Road resident, asked if the MMWAC debt is to expire in 2014, will fees be increased at that time.   Mr. Kazar said there are no plans for an increase.
Patti Mikkelsen, Intervale Road resident, asked what conclusions were reached at the Board of Selectmen’s Workshop on July 11th.   Mr. Libby said a sample committee application obtained from the Town of Raymond.   He said information will be forwarded to all committee members for their review and comments with responses due by September 16, 2011.   Mr. Libby said another Selectmen’s workshop could be held on September 26th, to review the data received.
IV.
SCHEDULED ITEMS
4.01
To See What Action the Board Wishes to Take in Regards to the Public Water Initial Engineering RFP

Mr. McHenry said on page 1 of the RFP, the second sentence after “under the direction” should read “of the New Gloucester Board of Selectmen and advisory of the New Gloucester Land Management Planning Committee”.

Paul First, Town Planner, and Matt Drumlin, of Drumlin Environmental, LLC, said they didn’t want to handicap the RFP by being too specific in some areas.     Mr. First said it is staffs hope to look to Drumlin Environmental, LLC for feedback on the proposals received.  He said he is hoping for an early November Special Town Meeting if all goes well with the engineering and design work.

Mr. McHenry moved Mr. Leighton seconded a motion to approve the Public Water Initial Engineering RFP with the recommended change.   The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.

4.02
To See What Action the Board Wishes to Take in Regards to Change Order #3 for the Morse Road Reconstruction Project

Mr. McHenry moved and Mr. Leighton seconded a motion to approve Change Order #3 for $2,200.   The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.
4.03
To See What Action the Board Wishes to Take in Regards to Bid Proposals for a Dump Body-Sand Spreader 

Please see Item 4.04.

4.04
To See What Action the Board Wishes to Take in Regards to Bid Proposals for a Snow Plow with Wing

The following bid proposals were opened for the Dump Body-Sand Spreader and Snow Plow with Wing:



Tenco New England, Inc., Berwick, ME & Barre, VT





Complete Package

$ 66,992.00


H. P. Fairfield, LLC, Skowhegan, ME




Dump Body-Sand Spreader
$ 40,500.00





Snow Plow with Wing
$ 30,250.00



Viking Cives (USA), Harrisville, NY





Complete Package

$ 69,664.48


Mr. Leighton moved and Mr. McHenry seconded a motion for staff to review and report back to the Board of Selectmen at the August 15th meeting.   The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.

4.05
To See What Action the Board Wishes to Take in Regards to Bid Proposals for Sand & Gravel 

The following bid proposals for Sand & Gravel were opened:



Bowie Excavating, New Gloucester, ME






Sub-base

no bid





Base


no bid





Standard Surface
no bid





M.D.O.T. Surface
no bid






Winter Sand

$  6.50 /cubic yard



Emerson Excavating, Windham, ME






Sub-base

$  5.50 /cubic yard






Base


$  6.50 /cubic yard






Standard Surface
$  6.50 /cubic yard






M.D.O.T. Surface
$  7.50 /cubic yard






Winter Sand

$  3.10 /cubic yard



K & K Excavation, Inc., Turner, ME






Sub-base

$  4.90 /cubic yard






Base


$  5.75 /cubic yard






Standard Surface
$  6.70 /cubic yard






M.D.O.T. Surface
$  7.10 /cubic yard






Winter Sand

$  5.00 /cubic yard



M. T. Pit, New Gloucester, ME






Sub-base

no bid






Base


no bid






Standard Surface
$  7.00 /cubic yard






M.D.O.T. Surface
no bid






Winter Sand

$  3.00 /cubic yard



Pike Industries, Inc., Westbrook, ME






Sub-base

$  7.28 /cubic yard






Base


$  8.82 /cubic yard






Standard Surface
$  7.28 /cubic yard






M.D.O.T. Surface
$  8.82 /cubic yard






Winter Sand

$  3.88 /cubic yard



Shaw Brothers Construction, Gorham, ME






Sub-base

$  8.48 /cubic yard






Base


$10.49 /cubic yard






Standard Surface
$11.49 /cubic yard






M.D.O.T. Surface
$12.48 /cubic yard






Winter Sand

$  5.98 /cubic yard



Portland Sand & Gravel, Inc., Cumberland, ME
Sub-base

$  5.00 /cubic yard






Base


$  5.00 /cubic yard






Standard Surface
$  9.00 /cubic yard






M.D.O.T. Surface
$  9.00 /cubic yard






Winter Sand

$  2.50 /cubic yard
Gorham Sand & Gravel, Buxton, ME





Sub-base

$10.00 /cubic yard






Base


$13.00 /cubic yard






Standard Surface
$11.00 /cubic yard






M.D.O.T. Surface
$15.00 /cubic yard






Winter Sand

$18.00 /cubic yard


P & K Sand & Gravel, Inc., Naples, ME






Sub-base

$10.50 /cubic yard






Base


$10.50 /cubic yard






Standard Surface
$  9.00 /cubic yard






M.D.O.T. Surface
$11.50 /cubic yard






Winter Sand

no bid


Mr. McHenry moved and Mr. Stevens seconded a motion for staff to review and make their recommendations to the Board of Selectmen at the August 15th Meeting.   The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.
4.06
To See What Action the Board Wishes to Take in Regards to Bid Proposals for a 1.3 yard Wheel Loader for the Transfer Station

Ted Shane, Public Works Director, said he recommends the 1.3 yard Wheel Loader bid be awarded to Chadwick-Baross, for a total cost of $69,000, for model L35B Volvo.

Mr. McHenry moved and Mr. Leighton seconded a motion to award the 1.3 yard Wheel Loader bid to Chadwick-Baross, for a total cost of $69,000, for a Volvo model #L35B.   The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.
4.07
To See What Action the Board Wishes to Take Regards to GPCOG Paving Bid Results


Mr. Shane said the paving was bid back in April and the cost of liquid asphalt has since gone up.   He said there are two low bidders, F. R. Carroll, Limerick, Maine, and Pine Tree Paving, Norway, Maine.  He said, if the cost of liquid asphalt goes back down before the paving is done in the Town, the cost per ton will also go down.


Mr. Leighton moved and Mr. Libby seconded a motion to award the GPCOG Paving Bid to F. R. Carroll, Limerick, ME.   The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.
4.08
To See What Action the Board Wishes to Take in Regard to Approving Roads to be Paved in FY11

Mr. Shane said he recommends shimming and overlay Bald Hill Road from Route 122 to the Poland/Auburn town line.

Mr. Leighton moved and Mr. Libby seconded a motion to shim and overlay Bald Hill Road from Route 122 to the Poland/Auburn town line.   The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.
4.09
To See What Action the Board Wishes to Take in Regards to Bid Specifications for Replacement of Engine 2

Gary Sacco, Fire/Rescue Chief, spoke of some of the information included in the bid specifications:  invitation to bid; the statement of intent; bonds; certificate of insurance; crash test information; where truck was built; time in business; information on the Emergency Vehicle Technicians; inspection trip; and chassis/frame assembly information; warranty information; manual for vehicle ordered; and additional options.   He said he would like to get the bid specifications out as soon as possible and bids to be received by August 15th.

Mr. Libby said he would like to see a bid form included with the RFP.   He said throughout the RFP, the word option’s is used when the item is a requirement.   He said if these words were swapped, it would be easier to understand, and then the last page of optional equipment is just that.

Mr. McHenry moved and Ms. Chase seconded a motion to approve the Bid Specifications for the Replacement of Engine 2 with a bid date of August 15th and with two changes: remove the word options when it is not an option; and include a package of information that would be returned by bidders.   The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.

4.10
To See What Action the Board Wishes to Take Regarding a Beano License Application for the Amvets Post #6

Please see item 4.11.
4.11
To See What Action the Board Wishes to Take in Regards to a Game of Chance Lucky 7 Application for the Lunn-Hunnewell Amvets Post #6


Mr. Leighton moved and Mr. Libby seconded a motion to table items 4.10 and 4.11 until the applications are complete.   The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.
4.12
To See What Action the Board Wishes to Take in Regards to Rolling Over Funds from FY11 to FY12

Mr. Libby read a memo from the Town Manager stating he would like to roll over $800 for the Account 113 Cable TV, to allow for a hardwired cable connection to be installed at a cost of approximately $50 per month plus installation costs.  He said research for the upcoming video streaming project revealed that a wireless internet connection is not adequate.

Mr. McHenry moved and Mr. Stevens seconded a motion to approve the $800 rollover for account 113 Cable TV conditional upon the Cable TV Committee attempting use of the existing wireless network and should that be unsecurable or technically be insufficient, then they proceed to install the hardwired network.   The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.


Mr. Libby read a memo from the Town Manager stating he would like to roll over $4,500 for the Account 133 Parks & Recreation, to provide additional funding for the Administrator for additional time for program start-up.


Mr. Leighton moved and Ms. Chase seconded a motion to approve the $4,500 rollover for account 133 Parks & Recreation. The motion carried on a vote of 4-1, with Mr. McHenry opposing.

Mr. Field asked for clarification on the motion for the $800 rollover for 113 Cable TV.


Mr. Libby said if the wireless internet connection could be done without intrusion, it would be required to be hooked up wireless.  


Mr. Field said funds would be expended to do this.


Mr. Leighton moved and Mr. Libby seconded a motion to reconsider the $800 rollover for account 113 Cable TV.  The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.


Mr. Leighton moved and Mr. McHenry seconded a motion to approve the $800 rollover for account 113 Cable TV for the hard wired internet access.   The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.
V.
WARRANTS AND PAYROLLS 

A.
APPROVE FY11 WARRANTS and PAYROLLS #51, #52 and #53
Mr. Leighton moved and Mr. Libby seconded a motion to approve FY11 Warrants and Payrolls #51 and #53.   The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.

Mr. Leighton moved and Mr. Libby seconded a motion to approve FY11 Warrants and Payrolls #52.   The motion carried on a vote of 4-1, with Mr. McHenry opposing.

B.
APPROVE FY12 WARRANTS AND PAYROLLS #1 and #2
Ms. Chase moved and Mr. Libby seconded a motion to approve FY12 Warrants and Payrolls #1 and #2.   The motion carried on a vote of 4-0-1, with Mr. McHenry abstaining.

VI.
APPOINTMENTS

A.
Economic Development Committee – ( 2 – 3 year vacancies)
Michael G. Splane – would like to be appointed to a two-year term

Mr. McHenry moved and Mr. Libby seconded a motion to appoint Michael G. Splane to the Economic Development Committee for a three-year term.   The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.


B.
Community Fair Committee - no maximum number of members defined and all 

 term lengths available



Kathleen A. Bardier – would like to be appointed to a one-year term


Michael Bardier – would like to be appointed to a three-year term
Marilyn A. Brinnick – would like to be appointed to a three-year term
Ms. Chase moved and Mr. Leighton seconded a motion to appoint to the Community Fair Committee, Kathleen A. Bardier for a one-year term, and Michael Bardier and Marilyn A. Brinnick for three-year terms.  The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.
C.
Selectmen Liaisons to Boards & Committees 


 
 1.  
Budget Committee (non-voting)






Linda Chase and Joshua McHenry


  
2.  
Business Communications





Mark Leighton - Chandler Brothers






Steven Libby - Pineland Farms





Mark Stevens – Opportunity Farm





Mark Leighton - Shakers



  3.
Cable TV Committee (non-voting)





Steven Libby


  
4.  
CDBG Municipal Oversight Committee





David Lunt



  5.
CIP Committee (voting)





Steven Libby



  6. 
Community Fair Committee





Mark Stevens




  7.
Cumberland County Budget Advisory Committee





Mark Stevens




  8.
Environmental Resources Committee (voting)





Joshua McHenry



  9.
Foreclosure Committee





Mark Leighton and Steven Libby



10.
Land Management Planning Committee (voting)





Mark Leighton



11.
Library Board of Trustees (non-voting)





Mark Leighton



12.
MMWAC (voting) 





Sumner Field and Steven Libby




13.
Parks & Recreation Committee (non-voting)





Linda Chase and Mark Stevens



14.
Public Safety Committee (voting)





No Liaison Appointed



15.
School Board (non-voting)






Joshua McHenry

Mr. Leighton moved and Ms. Chase seconded a motion to adopt the list of Selectmen Liaisons as discussed.  The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.
VII.
LEGAL

None.

VIII.
WRITTEN COMMUNICATION
A. Approve Minutes of the June 20, 2011, Board of Selectmen’s Meeting 
Mr. McHenry moved and Mr. Leighton seconded a motion to approve the Minutes of the June 20, 2011, Board of Selectmen’s Meeting.   The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.
IX.  
ORAL COMMUNICATION
A.
Selectmen

Mark Stevens – no comments.

Joshua McHenry – asked Staff for an update on the status of the Energy Efficiency Grant.  Mr. Field said he would look into this.  Mr. McHenry said he noticed while reviewing the warrants, the Town credit card has accumulated 20,000 world points and if there is any plan to use them.  Mr. Field said he would look into this.
Mark Leighton – no comments.
Linda Chase – no comments.

Steven Libby – said he has met as needed with Mr. Leighton, Mr. Field, Mr. Shane and Norm Chamberlain concerning the Morse Road project.   He said if any residents have any concerns to please contact either Mr. Shane, Mr. Field or speak with Larry, the foreman on the project.   He said communication is necessary for all involved to make this project a success.

B.
Town Manager
Mr. Field said a citizen brought in copies of animal controls laws and asked that they be shared with the Board of Selectmen.

C.
Boards, Department Heads, and Committees
X.
ADJOURN
Mr. Leighton moved and Mr. Libby seconded a motion to adjourn at 10:00 p.m.   The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.

Approved August 15, 2011
___________________________________
____________________________________

Steven M. Libby, Chairman


Linda D. Chase, Vice-Chairman

___________________________________
____________________________________

Mark A. Leighton, Selectman


Joshua J. McHenry, Selectman
___________________________________

Mark A. Stevens, Selectman
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