MINUTES
Town of New Gloucester

BOARD OF SELECTMEN’S MEETING

7:00 p.m.
Monday, May 20, 2013
At the Meetinghouse
BOARD OF SELECTMEN’S MEETING

I.
CALL THE MEETING TO ORDER & ATTENDANCE 
Chairman, Steven Libby, called the meeting to order at 7:03 p.m.  Present were Chairman, Steven Libby; Vice-Chairman, Linda Chase; Selectmen, Nathaniel Berry, Joshua McHenry and Mark Stevens; Town Manager, Sumner Field; and Recorder, Sharlene Myers. 
II.
SCHEDULE NEXT MEETINGS:

Annual Town Meeting:



7:00 p.m., Monday, June 3, 2013 at Memorial School


Board of Selectmen:

7:00 p.m., Monday, June 17, 2013 at the Meetinghouse
Mr. Libby said the Annual Town Meeting is Monday, June 3, 2013, at 7:00 p.m.   He said the Town Office will be closing at 6:00 p.m. and everyone should enter through the main entrance of Memorial School, 86 Intervale Road.  He said check-in starts at the school gym entrance at 6:30 p.m. and no one will be able to enter the gym via the outside doors.

A.
Adjustments to the Agenda 



None.

III.
PUBLIC PARTICIPATION  

None.

IV.
SCHEDULED ITEMS
5.05
To See What Action the Board Wishes to Take in Regards to the SAD 15 Budget Validation Referendum

Mr. McHenry moved and Mr. Berry seconded a motion to sign the Warrant and Notice of Election Calling SAD #15 Budget Validation Referendum.   The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.
5.06
To See What Action the Board Wishes to Take in Regards to the Town and SAD #15 Election Warrant

Mr. Berry moved and Mr. Stevens seconded a motion to sign the Town and SAD #15 Election Warrant.


Mr. McHenry asked if the location on the warrant was updated to read Fire Station.  He also asked the wording on Article 2 be changed to read “Assessors and Overseers” for future documents.

Mr. Field said the copy being signed has the Fire Station as the location.

The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.

5.07
To See What Action the Board Wishes to Take in Regard to Bid Proposals for Woodman Road Project

The following bids were opened:









Standard
Rip Rap



Bidder



Sub-base
 Surface
Standard


K & K Excavation, Inc.

$6.25

$7.00

$14.00



Turner, Maine


Portland Sand & Gravel, Inc.

$6.00

$10.00

no bid



Cumberland, Maine


Scott Dugas Trucking &

no bid

no bid

$22.00



Excavating, Inc.



Yarmouth, Maine


Duayne Maschino & Son

$7.50

no bid

no bid



Sand & Gravel




New Gloucester, Maine


Bowie Excavating


$7.00

no bid

$18.00



New Gloucester, Maine


Pike Industries, Inc.


$6.89

$6.89

$16.80



Westbrook, Maine


Shaw Brothers Construction, Inc.
$7.50

$8.50

$21.00


Gorham, Maine

Gendron & Gendron, Inc.

$8.50

$9.75

$22.00


Lewiston, Maine

M-T Pit and Excavation

no bid

$7.25

no bid


New Gloucester, Maine

A. H. Grover, Inc.


$7.75

$8.75

$18.00

Cumberland, Maine



P & K Sand & Gravel, Inc.

$8.35

$10.75

$11.15




Naples, Maine

Mr. Berry moved and Ms. Chase seconded a motion for Ted Shane, Public Works Director, to report back to the Board with his recommendation.   The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.
V.
APPROVE FY13 WARRANTS and PAYROLLS #45 & #46
Ms. Chase moved and Mr. Stevens seconded a motion to approve FY13 Warrants and Payrolls #45 & #46.   The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.
VI.
APPOINTMENTS


None.
VII.
LEGAL

None.
VIII.
WRITTEN COMMUNICATION

A. Approve Minutes of the May 6, 2013, Board of Assessor’s & Board of Selectmen’s Meeting

B. Approve Minutes of the May 13, 2013, Special Board of Selectmen’s Meeting

Mr. Berry moved and Ms. Chase seconded a motion to approve the Minutes of the May 6, 2013, Board of Assessor’s & Board of Selectmen’s Meeting and the Minutes of the May 13, 2013, Special Board of Selectmen’s Meeting.

Mr. McHenry said on the May 13th, Special Board of Selectmen’s Meeting minutes, page 3, Item 5.03, fourth paragraph, the second sentence should after the word development “but not allow existing properties to become solely commercial”.
The motion carried, with amendments, on a vote of 5-0.

IX.  
ORAL COMMUNICATION
A. Selectmen
Mark Stevens – said he hopes to see a lot of people at the Memorial Day parade.

Joshua McHenry – said he would like to encourage people to attend the Memorial Day parade, the Annual Town Meeting and the upcoming Election.  He also said it has been a pleasure to serve on the Board of Selectmen and that it has been a learning experience.

Nathaniel Berry – no comments.

Linda Chase – no comments.

Steven Libby – said he would also like to people to attend the Memorial Day parade, the Annual Town Meeting and the upcoming Election.

B. Town Manager
No comments.

C.
Boards, Department Heads, and Committees
X.
EXECUTIVE SESSION

A.
Per M.R.S.A. 31 Title 1, Chapter 13 § 405, 6. A.   Discussion or consideration of the employment, appointment, assignment, duties, promotion, demotion, compensation, evaluation, disciplining, resignation or dismissal of an individual or group of public officials, appointees or employees of the body or agency or the investigation or hearing of charges or complaints against a person or persons  . . . (Town Manager’s review)
Ms. Chase moved and Mr. Berry seconded a motion to go into Executive Session in reference to the Town Manager’s review, at 7:25 p.m.   The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.
XI.
RETURN TO OPEN SESSION


The Board returned to open session at 8:28 p.m.

The Town Manager proposed hiring a neutral moderator for Town Meeting.  After discussion, the Board directed the Town Manager to call around to see who other Towns use as moderator.

Mr. Berry moved and Ms. Chase seconded a motion to approve a 2% merit increase for the Town Manager, effective July 1, 2013.   The motion carried on a vote of 3-2, with Mr. McHenry and Mr. Stevens opposing.
XII.
ADJOURN 
Mr. McHenry moved and Mr. Berry seconded a motion to adjourn at 8:45 p.m.  The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.

Approved June 17, 2013

___________________________________
____________________________________

Steven M. Libby, Chairman


Linda D. Chase, Vice-Chairman

___________________________________
____________________________________

Nathaniel L. Berry IV, Selectman

Joshua J. McHenry, Selectman




___________________________________


Mark A. Stevens, Selectman
May 20, 2013 Minutes
Board of Selectmen’s Meeting
PAGE  
4
May 20, 2013 Minutes
Board of Selectmen’s Meeting

