MINUTES
Town of New Gloucester

BOARD OF ASSESSOR’S & BOARD OF SELECTMEN’S MEETING
7:00 p.m.

Monday, July 2, 2012
At the Meetinghouse
BOARD OF ASSESSOR’S MEETING

7:00 p.m.
 I.
CALL THE MEETING TO ORDER & ATTENDANCE 

Chairman, Steven Libby, called the meeting to order at 7:00 p.m.  Present were Chairman, Steven Libby; Vice-Chairman, Linda Chase; Nathaniel Berry, Joshua McHenry and Mark Stevens; Town Manager, Sumner Field; and Recorder, Sharlene Myers.  

II
To See What Action the Board Wishes to Take in Regard to 2012-13 Abatement, Batch #1
Mr. McHenry moved and Mr. Stevens seconded a motion to approve 2012-13 Abatement, Batch #1.   The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.

III.
ADJOURN

Mr. Berry moved and Mr. McHenry seconded a motion to adjourn at 7:01 p.m.  The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.
BOARD OF SELECTMEN’S MEETING

I.
CALL THE MEETING TO ORDER & ATTENDANCE 

Chairman, Steven Libby, called the meeting to order at 7:02 p.m.  Present were Chairman, Steven Libby; Vice-Chairman, Linda Chase; Nathaniel Berry, Joshua McHenry and Mark Stevens; Town Manager, Sumner Field; and Recorder, Sharlene Myers.  

II.
SCHEDULED NEXT MEETING:

Board of Selectmen – 7:00 p.m., Monday, July 16, 2012 at the Meetinghouse

A.
Adjustments to the Agenda
Mr. McHenry moved and Mr. Stevens seconded a motion to add Item #4.11, To See What Action the Board Wishes to Take in Regards to Discussion of Committee Reports.   The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.

III
PUBLIC PARTICIPATION

Stephen Hathorne, resident, presented to the Board a petition to request the restoration of Stevens Pond to its original purpose of servicing the community as a recreational, fishing and fire protection pond, and signed by over 250 residents.
Mr. Libby said he drafted a proposed policy for Stevens Brook and it is on the agenda for discussion later in the meeting.
Mr. Hathorne also stated he would like the Board to reconsider their decision on concrete versus granite curbing that will be installed in the lower village later this summer.

Mr. Libby said Ms. Chase, Paul First, Town Planner, and himself attended the Maine Turnpike Authority Public Hearing concerning the proposed toll increases.  He said Lois Snowe Mello and Ellie Espling were also in attendance.   He said there were approximately 150 in attendance and over 50 people spoke concerning increases.   He said the Maine Turnpike Authority stated that there is a traffic issue pertaining to the avoidance of the New Gloucester toll booth.
IV.
SCHEDULED ITEMS
4.01
To See What Action the Board Wishes to Take in Regards to Sand & Gravel Bids

The following bid proposals for Sand & Gravel were opened:



Pike Industries, Inc., Westbrook, ME






Sub-base

$  7.49 /cubic yard






Base


$  8.96 /cubic yard






Standard Surface
$  7.49 /cubic yard






M.D.O.T. Surface
$  8.96 /cubic yard






Winter Sand

$  3.64 /cubic yard

Shaw Brothers Construction, Gorham, ME






Sub-base

$  9.00 /cubic yard






Base


$13.00 /cubic yard






Standard Surface
$10.75 /cubic yard






M.D.O.T. Surface
$13.00 /cubic yard






Winter Sand

$  7.00 /cubic yard



M-T Pit, New Gloucester, ME






Sub-base

no bid





Base


no bid





Standard Surface
$  6.70 /cubic yard






M.D.O.T. Surface
no bid





Winter Sand

$  2.50 /cubic yard



St. Laurent & Son, Inc., Lewiston, ME






Sub-base

$  5.94 /cubic yard






Base


$  6.94 /cubic yard






Standard Surface
$  5.38 /cubic yard






M.D.O.T. Surface
$  6.94 /cubic yard






Winter Sand

$  4.94 /cubic yard



Emerson Excavating, Windham, ME






Sub-base

$  5.50 /cubic yard






Base


$  6.50 /cubic yard






Standard Surface
$  6.50 /cubic yard






M.D.O.T. Surface
$  7.50 /cubic yard






Winter Sand

$  3.10 /cubic yard



Bowie Excavating, New Gloucester, ME






Sub-base

no bid





Base


no bid





Standard Surface
no bid





M.D.O.T. Surface
no bid





Winter Sand

$  6.50 /cubic yard



Gorham Sand & Gravel, Buxton, ME






Sub-base

$13.00 /cubic yard






Base


$15.00 /cubic yard






Standard Surface
$15.00 /cubic yard






M.D.O.T. Surface
$15.00 /cubic yard






Winter Sand

$  7.00 /cubic yard



Portland Sand & Gravel, Inc., Gray, ME






Sub-base

$  5.00 /cubic yard






Base


$  5.00 /cubic yard






Standard Surface
$  9.00 /cubic yard






M.D.O.T. Surface
$  9.00 /cubic yard






Winter Sand

$  2.50 /cubic yard


Mr. Stevens moved and Mr. McHenry seconded a motion for staff to review and make their recommendations to the Board of Selectmen at the July 18th meeting.   The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.

4.02
To See What Action the Board Wishes to Take Regards to Approving Cost of Pavement

Ted Shane, Public Works Director, said he received four bids for paving and he recommends awarding the pavement bid to Pike Industries at a cost of $67.89 per ton, which includes tack and grinding butt joints.


Mr. Berry moved and Mr. McHenry seconded a motion to award the paving bid to Pike Industries at a cost of 67.89 per ton including tack and grinding butt joints.  The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.

4.03
To See What Action the Board Wishes to Take in Regard to Approving Roads to be Paved in FY13

Mr. Shane said he would like to remove Chandler Mill Road from paving this year and move to FY14.  He said with the current bridge construction, big trucks on the new pavement would cause damage.  He would like to recommend paving Church Road in its place.  He said he would also like to recommend not paving Cobbs Bridge Road in FY13 and replace it with Morse Road from Route 100 to Chestnut Common, and move Cobbs Bridge Road to FY14.   Mr. Shane said Bald Hill Road will be ready to pave in two weeks.  He also stated that once these roads are completed, he will come back to the Board with recommendations for balance of paving and an updated Pavement Management plan.

Mr. Berry moved and Ms. Chase seconded a motion to approve the roads to be paved in FY13:  Bald Hill Road; Tobey Road (both sides); Morse Road from Route 100 to Chestnut Common; and Church Road from Route 100 to Gloucester Hill Road, and come back to the board with recommendations for the balance.  The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.
4.04
To See What Action the Board Wishes to Take in Regards to Beano Application for Amvets Post 6 and Auxiliary

Mr. McHenry moved and Mr. Berry seconded a motion to approve the Beano Application for Amvets Post 6 and Auxiliary and to note there are no violations or complaints on file per the Code Enforcement Officer.   The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.

4.05
To See What Action the Board Wishes to Take in Regards to Easement of Lower Corner School House Lot

Mr. Libby asked Mr. Coggeshall to file all measurements with the Town once project is completed.   


Mr. McHenry asked if there is any payment – annual or one-time fee – for this property (easement).  He suggested an amount of a $1.00, one-time payment.


Mr. McHenry moved and Mr. Stevens seconded a motion to sign the Lower Corner School House Lot easement deed with a one-time payment fee of $1.00 and all relevant measurements be recorded with the Town of New Gloucester.   The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.
4.06
To See What Action the Board Wishes to Take in Regards to Quitclaim Deeds for Tax Acquired Properties 
Mr. McHenry moved and Mr. Stevens seconded a motion to sign the Quitclaim Deed for Map 1 Lot 17-3.   The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.
There was no action taken on the Quitclaim Deed for Map 2 Lot 17.

4.07
To See What Action the Board Wishes to Take in Regards to Advertising of Tax Acquired Property For Sale

The Board discussed the following changes to the Tax Acquired Property for Sale ad:  minimum bid should include the past due taxes plus interest and cost through August 6th, along with advertisement fees and any additional fees incurred; bids to be accepted by 6:00 p.m. on Monday, August 6, 2012; bids to be opened on Monday, August 6, 2012, at 7:00 p.m.; no required bid deposit; in the first paragraph, last sentence, change the word award to awarded; award date is Monday, August 20, 2012, at 7:00 p.m.; and full payment is due by August 27, 2012.   

Mr. Libby said the abutters of these three parcels should be notified and asked how this sale would be advertised.


Mr. Field said it would be advertised in the Lewiston Sun Journal, Lakes Region Weekly, Channel 3, Town Website and on the bulletin board at the Town Hall.


Mr. McHenry moved and Mr. Berry seconded a motion to advertise the tax acquired property as amended.   The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.

4.08
To See What Action the Board Wishes to Take in Regards to Carry Forward Funds from FY12 to FY13


Mr. Libby asked for more information as to why these funds are to be carried forward.


Mr. Field said he would like to carry forward $21,783 from the Outlet Road Bridge capital project.  He said $25,000 was approved for engineering and repairs and this past year, repairs were necessary to the guardrails on the Outlet Road Bridge.  He said $21,783, is the balance left and would like to carry forward for the engineering costs for the bridge.  Mr. Field said he would like to carry forward $3,215, from the Fire Truck capital project account.  He said the truck is near completion and upon delivery, these funds will cover the balance of the work to be completed on it.   Mr. Field said he would like to carry forward $6,250 from Unbudgeted (account 130-5-47) for the radon water system installed for the Town complex.   He said tests were done on the water and high amounts of radon were detected.  He said Goodwin Well Drilling ordered the system in June and installed the system this past week and he would like to carry forward the funds to cover the expense.

Mr. Berry moved and Ms. Chase seconded a motion to carry forward all funds as presented.   The motion carried on a vote of 3-2, with Mr. McHenry and Mr. Stevens opposing.
4.09
To See What Action the Board Wishes to Take in Regards to Stevens Brook Fire Pond Policy

Mr. Libby read a draft of the proposed Stevens Brook policy.  He said one item was left blank and that is who will be responsible for the removal and reinstallation of the planks under section 5, item b.
Gary Sacco, Fire/Rescue Chief, said his department has previously been the ones who have pulled the planks and put them back in to help maintain this pond as a fire pond.   He said he would like to see the Public Works Department carry out this responsibility.  

Ted Shane, Public Works Director, said Public Works can pull/replace the boards.   He said the boards should be pulled before a storm and the department will do the best they can.   
Mr. Libby said citizens should not get involved with the removal or replacement of the planks.  

Mr. Berry said he would like to add a line to the policy.   He said under section #2, item E., Emergency Situation.  

Mr. Berry moved and Mr. McHenry seconded a motion to accept the Stevens Brook Policy with the addition under section 2, Item E, Emergency Situation and section 5, item B, the blank should be replaced with Public Works Department.   The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.
4.10
To See What Action the Board Wishes to Take in Regards to CIP Committee Recommendation to Increase Request Minimum to $15,000

Mr. Field said the minimum set for CIP requests is $7,500.   He said he made a presentation to the CIP Committee.  After discussion, the Committee voted to recommend raising the amount to $15,000.   


Beverly Cadigan, Vice-Chairman of the CIP Committee, said in May of 2002, the minimum amount was raised from $3,500 to $7,500.  She said it has been ten years and says the increase would help make it easier for the smaller requests to happen.  

Mr. Berry moved and Mr. McHenry seconded a motion to forward to the annual Town Meeting, the request to increase the CIP minimum request amount to $15,000.   The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.

4.11
To See What Action the Board Wishes to Take in Regards to Discussion of Committee Reports

Mr. McHenry said Boards and Committees should be required to submit reports to the Board of Selectmen reporting on their activities on a quarterly basis.  


Mr. Libby said it is helpful if minutes are received from the Board/Committees.

Mr. Berry said Community Fair and Public Safety Committees send the minutes via email to members after approved.


Mr. Libby asked Mr. Field to report back to the Board with a list of Boards/Committees that take minutes and those that don’t.
V.
APPROVE FY12 WARRANTS and PAYROLLS #51 and #52
Mr. Berry moved and Mr. McHenry seconded a motion to approve FY12 Warrants and Payrolls #52.  The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.

Mr. Stevens moved and Mr. Berry seconded a motion to approve FY12 Warrants and Payrolls #51.  The motion carried on a vote of 4-1, with Mr. McHenry opposing.

VI.
APPOINTMENTS

A.
Library Board of Trustees


Allison Kostovick
Ms. Chase moved and Mr. Stevens seconded a motion to appoint Allison Kostovick to the Library Board of Trustees for the completion of a 2013 term.   The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.

B.
Selectmen Liaisons to Boards & Committees 


  1.  
Budget Committee (non-voting)





Linda Chase and Joshua McHenry


  2.  
Business Communications




Nathaniel Berry - Chandler Brothers




Mark Stevens -Opportunity Farm




Steven Libby - Pineland Farms





Linda Chase - Shakers


  3.
Cable TV Committee (non-voting)




Steven Libby


  4.  
CDBG Municipal Oversight Committee
David Lunt 



  5.
CIP Committee (voting)




Steven Libby


  6. 
Community Fair Committee (non-voting)




Mark Stevens






  7.
Cumberland County Budget Advisory Committee




To be determined at future meeting


  8.
Environmental Resources Committee (voting)




Joshua McHenry


  9.
Foreclosure Committee (voting)




Steven Libby and Linda Chase


10.
Land Management Planning Committee (voting)




Linda Chase


11.
Library Board of Trustees (non-voting)




Joshua McHenry


12.
MMWAC (voting) 




Sumner Field and Steven Libby


13.
Parks & Recreation Committee (non-voting)




Linda Chase and Mark Stevens



14.
Public Safety Committee (voting)




Steven Libby


15.
School Board (non-voting)





Joshua McHenry

Mr. Stevens said he would like to continue as the Liaison on the Cumberland County Budget Advisory Committee.   Mr. Berry said he received an email from the Steven Gordon about being on the Committee.   Mr. Libby asked Mr. Field to contact Mr. Gordon for further information on this appointment.
Mr. Stevens asked about the voting/non-voting status of the Liaison on the Environmental Resources Committee.   Mr. Libby asked Mr. Field to look into this
Ms. Chase moved and Mr. McHenry seconded a motion to approve the Selectmen Liaisons as discussed with the exception of the Cumberland County Budget Advisory Committee.  The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.

VII.
LEGAL


None.

VIII.
WRITTEN COMMUNICATION
A.  Approve Minutes of the June 18,  2012, Board of Selectmen’s Meeting

Mr. McHenry moved and Mr. Berry seconded a motion to approve the June 18, 2012, Board of Selectmen’s meeting minutes and to attach Mr. Libby’s note pertaining to usage of TIF funds for the Morse Road culvert work.  The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.

IX.  
ORAL COMMUNICATION
A.
Selectmen

Mark Stevens – no comments


Joshua McHenry – no comments

Nathaniel Berry – said he drafted a policy concerning cell phone usage at and during meetings, which he handed out to Board members.  He said this is a working document and would like to the Board to review and make needed changes.

Linda Chase – said July 4th is Wednesday and with the new state law allowing fireworks, she urged everyone to be safe and cautious.

Steven Libby – said he has heard fireworks around town and to please abide by the state laws.  He urged people to please follow instructions when using them and be safe.


B.
Town Manager
Mr. Field said he handed out a salary survey at the previous Selectmen’s meeting and would like to hold a workshop to discuss and establish salary ranges for each position.  

Mr. Libby asked the Board to send any suggestions and/or comments to the Town Manager.  He said Ms. Chase and himself will email the Town Manager to set a date in August for a Selectmen’s workshop.

C.
Boards, Department Heads, and Committees
X.
ADJOURN
Mr. Berry moved and Mr. Stevens seconded a motion to adjourn at 9:27 p.m.   The motion carried on a vote of 5-0.

Approved July 16, 2012
___________________________________
____________________________________

Steven M. Libby, Chairman


Linda D. Chase, Vice-Chairman

___________________________________
____________________________________

Nathaniel L. Berry IV, Selectman

Joshua J. McHenry, Selectman




___________________________________


Mark A. Stevens, Selectman
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